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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aCer the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date :2012-08-01 Pages: 315 Publisher: Higher Education Press title:
Ordinary Higher Education Eleventh Five-Year national planning materials colleges e-commerce professional
textbook series: Electronic Commerce ( 2) List Price: 34.00 yuan Author: Publisher: Higher Education Press
Publication Date: August 1. 2012 ISBN: 9787040346305 words: Page: 315 Edition: 2nd Edition Binding: Paperback:
Weight: 481 g Editor's Choice Ordinary Higher Education Eleventh Five-Year national planning materials
colleges e-commerce professional textbook series: Electronic Commerce (2nd edition) as the College of Business
Administration class. economy class information class professional undergraduate raw materials are also
available in other majors and personnel with reference to the use of e-commerce interest. Executive Summary
Higher Education Eleventh Five-Year national planning materials colleges e-commerce professional series
textbooks: E-Commerce Introduction (2nd edition) to the course of business activity in the Internet environment.
the main line of the e-commerce activities marketing. transactions and payments as well as related technical
support and environmental measures for scientific and rational organization. focuses on the generation of e-
commerce development and e-commerce. the basic concept and business model; system to describe the
process of e-commerce business. including network marketing. transactions and payments. order processing.
logistics and distribution. and a brief description of the technical requirements of the development of electronic
commerce. social management mechanism. Directory first revelation Basics Amazon e-commerce Basics
Section: Why should the implementation of the basic concepts of e-commerce e-commerce section II. section III.
the e-commerce model and the framework of the fourth quarter e-commerce on the economy and
management Internet and corporate strategy Section II e-commerce strategy for the third quarter e-commerce
business model of the impact of Chapter Summary Keywords Review Questions Chapter Two e-commerce
strategy. planning and business...
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